NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION

2021-A-001 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS AUTO PARTS

VENDOR __RATE

Special item Rates

The best wholesale or
fleet price whichever is
B & G Auto Parls better

Corsicana Auto Parts LLC - NAPA |Wholesale or Better

Mills Auto Supply Dealer Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts Price less 41% or better

Contracts awarded to all bidders
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NAVARROU COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2021-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR; Wilson Culverts
DIAMETER (Inches) Gage
CULVERTS ({price per linear foot)
12 16 $ 8.09 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 |$ 10.11 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 3 12.09 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 16.09 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 |9 20.15 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 24.38 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 28.18 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 3 46.22 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
60 14 $ 56.94 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
72 14 $ 68.74 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
96 14 | % 80.77 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
DELIVERY 5 - 10 Business
Days
DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $ 12.13
15" $ 15.16
18" $ 18.13
24" $ 24.13
30" 3 30.22
36" b 36.52
42" 3 42.27
48" $ 116.13
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE
12" 2-12" 1% 118.20 | Pair w/bands
15" 2-15" | § 181.72 | Pair w/bands
18" 2-18" | % 257.52 | Pair w/ibands
24" 2-24" | § 395.36 | Pair w/bands
30" 2-30" 1% 565.04 | Pair w/bands
36" 2-36" | $ 781.22 | Pair w/bands
DELIVERY 5 - 10 Business
Days
CONTACT NAME Greg Barnett Manager
CONTACT PHONE 903-764-5605 wilsonculverts@hotmail.com

Contract awarded to: Wilson Culverts & ADS Inc

2021 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2021-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT

CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR:
DIAMETER {(Inches)

Gage

ADS, Inc

N-12 ST IB - High Density Polyethylene {HDPE} Dual Wall Culvert Piper per Ft

12 3 4.26 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #128500201B
15 $ 6.07 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #158500201B
18 $ 8.46 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #18850020IB
24 $ 14.43 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #2485002018
30 $ 19.57 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #3085002018
36 d 25.83 | ADS N-12 ST |B - #368500201B
42 $ 31.63 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #428500201B
48 $ 40.63 | ADS N-12 ST B - #488500201B
60 $ 67.00 | ADS N-12 ST IB - #608500201B
72 $ - NO BID
96 3 - NO BID
DELIVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS
PREMIUM SPLIT COUPLERS (price each)

12" 3 4.26
15" b 6.07
18" $ 8.46
24" $ 14,43
30" $ 19.57
36" $ 25.83
42" $ 63.26
48" $ 81.26

2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE
12" 3 - NO BID
15" $ - NO BID
18" $ - NO BID
24" $ - NO BID
30" 5 - NO BID
36" b - NO BID

DELIVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS
CONTACT NAME Jason Hannan Sales Rep - North, TX cc
CONTACT PHONE 214-724-9729 jason.hannan@ads-pipe.com co

a) Joint sections are available in 20' lengths with soil-tight bell-and-spigot connenction.
b) Joint sections are also available in 24' and 30’ lengths with Plain Ends, coupling band required to join.

* Pricing is good for one year, 10/01/2020 - 09/30/2021.
* ADS will deliver on a dropside trailer to County yard or jobsite at above pricing.
* Minimum $2,400 order or $100.00 drop fee applies.

* Couplers equal to one (1) foot of pipe (12" - 36"), equal to two (2) feet of pipe (42", 48" & 60")

2021 BID TABS



NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2021-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR: ADS, Inc
(Inches) Gage
HP Storm - Polypropylene (PP) Dual Wall Culvert Pipe per Ft

12 $ 6.65 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #126500201BPL
15 $ 9.05 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #156500201BPL
18 3 12.35 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #18650020/BPL
24 $ 18.85 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #24650020!BPL
30 $ 29.55 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #306500201BPL
36 3 33.40 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #366500201BPL
42 $ 44.25 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #426500201BPL
48 3 54.95 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #48650020/BPL
60 3 81.10 | ADS HP Storm - Polypropylene #60650020I18PL
72 $ - NO BID
96 P - NO BID

DELWVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS

PREMIUM SPLIT COUPLERS (price each)
12" $ 6.65
15" 3 9.05
18" b 12.35
24" d 18.85
30" $ 29.55
36" $ 34.40
42" $ 88.50
48" $ 109.90
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE

12" $ - NO BID
15" 3 - NO BID
18" 3 - NO BID
24" $ - NO BID
30" b - NO BID
36" $ - NO BID

DELIVERY 5 BUSINESS DAYS

INTACT NAME Jason Hannan | Sales Rep - North, TX

NTACT PHONE 214-724-9729 | jason.hannan@ads-pipe.com

a) Joint sections are available in 20’ lengths with soil-tight bell-and-spigot connenction.

b} Joint sections are also available in 24' and 30’ lengths with Plain Ends, coupling band required to join.
* Pricing is good for one year, 10/01/2020 - 09/30/2021.

* ADS will deliver on a dropside trailer to County yard or jobsite at above pricing.

* Minimum $2,400 order or $100.00 drop fee applies.

* Couplers equal to one (1) foot of pipe (12" - 36"), equal to two (2) feet of pipe (42", 48" & 60")

2021 BID TABS



NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2021-F-004 - ANNUAL CONTRACT

FUEL FOR COUNTY VEHICLES
VENDOR Johnson Oil
UNLEADED
Grade 87 Octane 87 Octane 89 Octane
Rack Price 1.2695
Tax 0.2000
Freight
Profit 0.0750
Total Cost 1.5445
Primary Distributor Flint Hills - Waco
DIESEL

Rack Price 1.2575
Tax 0.2000
Freight
Profit 0.0750
Total Cost 1.56325
Primary Distributor Flint Hills - Waco

CONTACT NAME Michelle Boyd Sales Administrator

CONTACT PHONE 903-872-6621

Bid awarded to: Johnson Oil

2021 BID TAB
FUEL




Precinl 1 - Hwy 22 Corsicana

Coker & Son Havoc

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T 8ar D Trucking Tommy Monigomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 12.00 14.32 8.25 12.50 11.95
Blum Materlal Rale - Flox Basa A Grade 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 17.50 19.82 14.75 18.00 17.45
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 13.10 14.97 13.00 14.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 900

Total Cost 22.10 23.97 22.00 23.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 13.10 14.97 13.00 14.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 9.50 950 9.50 9.50
Total Cost 22.60 24.47 22.50 23.50 27.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6.60 239 6.50 10.00 6.00
Corsicana Material Rale - Hot Mix 65 00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Tota!l Cost 71.60 67.39 71.50 75.00 71.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 941 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase A/M/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Tolal Cost 8.00 17.11 8.00 18.00 16.75
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 9.11 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 17.50 16.25
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 9.1 NO BID 10.00 8.75
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 2911 20.00 30.00 28.75
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate 40.00 36.02 40.00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Calonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416 50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 452.52 456,50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate B.45 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 16.20 17.51 16.23 16.75 16.50
Conners Canstruction Co Hauling Rate 8.45 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base Af2f2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 15.95 17.26 15.98 16.50 16.25
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 8.50 9.76 8.48 9.00 8.75
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 1&2 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 16.50 17.76 16.48 17.00 16.75
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 6.00 5.42 6.00 10.00 8.75
Knife River - Sky High Material Rale - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25
Tolat Cost 35.25 34,67 35.25 39.25 38.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 12.15 13.00 12.00 10.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Tolal Cost 73.00 72.15 73.00 72.00 70.50




Knie River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

|Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Mariatta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - Slate Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale -Non Spec Base 5/8" Ar2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Ralte - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontested Flex Base
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Ot Sand
Tolal Cost

13.00 12.15 13.00 12.00 10.50
65.00 £5.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
78.00 20.25 78.00 77.00 75.50
NO BID 9.11 NO BID 12.00 B.75
8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25
8.25 20.25 8.25 2035 17.00
6.10 2.39 6.50 5.00 6.00
18.00 18.00 18.00 18 00 18.00
24.10 20.25 24,50 23.00 24.00
6.10 2.39 6.50 5.00 6.00
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
22.60 2025 23.00 21.50 22,50
6.10 239 6.50 5.00 6.00
2300 23.00 2300 2300 23.00
2910 25.39 29.50 28.00 29.00
6.10 2.39 6.50 5.00 6.00
20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
26.10 22.39 26.50 25.00 26.00
12.90 15,19 12.20 14,00 12.50
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
19.15 21.44 18.45 20.25 18.75
12,90 15.19 12.20 14.00 12.50
1250 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
25.40 27.69 24.70 26.50 25.00
12.90 15.19 12.20 14.00 12.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
24.40 26.69 23.70 2550 24.00
12.90 15.19 12.20 14,00 12.50
B.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 B.00
20.90 23.19 20.20 22.00 20.50
12.00 14.32 11.80 12.00 11.95
625 625 6.25 6.25 6.25
18.25 2057 18.05 18.25 18.20
12.00 14.32 11.80 12,00 1195
7.25 7.5 7.25 7.25 7.25
19.25 2157 19.05 19.35 19.20
8.90 7.59 9.00 10.00 11.75
66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
74.90 7359 75.00 76.00 77.75




Texas mm_m
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Hot Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Hot Mix Cold Mix
Total Cost

8.90 7.58 9.00 10.00 11.75
81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
89.90 88.59 90.00 91.00 92.75
8.90 7.59 9.00 10.00 11.75
83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
91,90 90.59 92.00 93.00 94.75
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Trucks In Trucks in Trucks In Trucks in Fleat
Flest {Untimited) Fleet {5) Fleet {Uniimited) | Fleet (Unlimited) {Uniimited)
$85.00 Per Hr $75.00 Per Hr Delivery Time; Delivery Time:
$7.00 perton $6.00 por ton When Neaded Open
Bam to Jobsite Barn to Jobsite Min/Max MiniMax
.18 per loaded .18 per loaded Delivery Qty: Dolivery Qty:
ton per mile ton per mlle 12 min/27 max 13 min/25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
irom Barh lo Delivery Schadule
project slte, None
Hourly Truck work Bobtall $75.00 he
is $80.00 par hour Belly End Dump

within a 20-mile
radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
that isn’t covered
by the rate shest
{page 8) wiit be
figured at .20

per ton mite loaded

$100.00 per hr




Precinct 2 - Kerens

Coker & Son Havoe

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomary
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.75
Blum Malerial Rala - Flex Base A Grada 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 19.40 23.73 19.45 21.50 19.25
|Blg City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 14.55 1714 15.00 14.00 19.00
Dallas Material Rate - Wasle 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Total Cost 23.55 26.14 24.00 23.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 14.55 17.14 15.00 14.00 19.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
Tolal Cost 24.05 26.64 24.50 23.50 28.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6.60 412 6.50 10.00 7.00
Corsicana Material Rate - Hol Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 71.60 69,12 71.50 75.00 72.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 1.07 NO BID 10.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flexbase AM/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cosl 8.00 19.07 8.00 18.00 17.10
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 10.00 8.10
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - Flex Base Af2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Tolal Cost 22,00 23.00 7.50 17.50 16.60
Big Graek Construction Hauling Rate NO 81D 11.07 NC BID 10.00 9,10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cost 20.00 31.07 20.00 30.00 29.10
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate 40.00 35.58 40.00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rate - Calonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 452,08 456.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 11.2¢ 11.50 11.00 5.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rale - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 18.95 19.25 18.75 16.75 16.85
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 11.20 11.50 11.00 9.00 9.10
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base AJ2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 18.70 19.00 18.50 16.50 16.60
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 11.10 11.50 11.20 9.00 9.10
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - 2" Base Grade 1&2 & 247 A1 Grade 142 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 15.10 19.50 19,20 17.00 17.10
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 5.00 1.54 5.00 9.00 9.10
Krife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 2925 2925 2925 28.25
Total Cost 3425 30.79 34.25 38.25 38.35
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 15.00 15.19 15.00 14.00 14.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 75.00 75.19 75.00 74.00 74.00




Knife River Corp - South

Waco

Groesbeck

rsm:__.. Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Maristta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
ﬁm_:_.:

Knife River Corp - South

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base AJ2/2
‘Total Cosl

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - Stale Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Maierial Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Type "C" Limeslone & 3/8" Limeslone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontesled Flex Base
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - 3/8" Pea Grave!
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

15.00 15.19 15.00 14.00 14.00
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
80.00 20.25 80.00 79.00 79.00
NO BID 11.07 NO BID 14.00 9.10
825 8.25 825 8.25 B.25
8.25 20.25 B.25 2225 17.36
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
18.00 168.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
24.10 20.25 24.50 2325 24.50
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
22.60 20.25 23.00 21.75 23.00
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
2010 27.12 29.50 28.25 29.50
6.10 4.12 6.50 5.25 6.50
2000 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
26.10 24.12 26.50 2525 26.50
14.95 1B.44 15.00 16.00 14.00
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 625
21.20 24.69 21.25 2225 20.25
14.95 18.44 15.00 16.00 14.00
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
27.45 - 27.50 28.50 26,50
14.95 18.494 15.00 16.00 14.00
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
26.45 29.94 2650 27.50 25.50
14.95 18.44 15.00 16.00 14.00
800 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
2295 26.44 23.00 24.00 22.00
13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
20.15 24,48 20.20 2225 20.00
13.90 18.23 13.95 16.00 13.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
21.15 25.48 21.20 23.25 21.00

e i



within a 20.mile
radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
that Isn't covered
by the rate sheat
{page 9) will be
figured ot .20

pear ton mile loaded

Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 _66.00
Total Cost 73.00 69.69 72.80 75.00 75.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Taotal Cost 88.00 84.69 87.80 80.00 90.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 7.00 3.69 6.80 9.00 9.00
Malakoff Malerial Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost 90.00 86.69 89.80 92.00 92.00
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks In Trucks In Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet
Fleat {Unlimited) Fleet {5) Flest (Unlimited) | Flest (Unlimited) {Unlimited)
$85.00 Per Hr $75.00 Per Hr Delivary Time: Delivery Time:
$7.00 per ton $6.00 per ton When Needed Open
Bam 1o Jobsits Barn {o Jobsite MinfMax Min/Max
.18 per loaded .8 per loaded Delivery Qty: Dalivery Qty:
ton per mile lon per mile 12 mini27 max 13 min/28 max
$125.00 per load Limitations o
from Bam to Delivery Schaduls
project site. Nona
Hourly Truck work Bobtall $75.00 hr
is $80.00 per hour Belly End Dump

$100.00 per hr




Precinct 3 - Richland

Coker & Son Havoc
Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transporiation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Monigomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate NO BID 18.44 NO BID 13.00 13.75
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grada 1 & 2 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 5.50 23.94 5.50 18.50 19.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.14 NO BID 15,00 19.25
Dallas Material Rate - Wasle 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
Tolal Cost 9.00 26.14 9.00 24.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.14 NO BID 15.00 19.25
Dallas Material Rale - Crushed Concrele 9.50 550 9.50 5.50 9.50
Tolal Cosl 9.50 26.64 9.50 24.50 28.75
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 1.76 NO BID 6.50 7.50
Corsicana Material Rate - Hol Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 65.00 66.76 65.00 71.50 72.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BID 6.50 7.715
Groesbeck Malerial Rale - Flexbase A/1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 800
Total Cost 8.00 13.64 a.00 14.50 15.75
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BID 6.50 .75
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 14.00 15.25
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.64 NO BID 6.50 1.75
Groesbeck Material Rale - Type “C" Rock, Type "D" Rock, Grade 3 Coversione _20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 2000
Total Cost 20.00 25.64 20.00 26.50 2775
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate NO BID 32.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rale - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 416.50 449.26 416.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NOBID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 .75
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Total Cost 7.75 13.83 7.75 14.25 15.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 7.75
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 7.50 13.58 7.50 14.00 15.25
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate NOBID 6.08 NO BID 6.50 2.715
Groesheck Malerial Rate - 2 Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 800
Total Cost 8.00 14.08 8.00 14.50 15.75
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 10.00 7.75
Knife River - Sky High Material Rate - Flex Base Type Af1/2 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 29.25 |
Total Coslt 29.25 36.19 29.25 39.25 37.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 14.00 14.00
Waco Malerial Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 60.00 72.58 60.00 74.00 74.00

T



Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

r_s_um Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, tnc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Stale Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" Aj2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C” Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 1" Limeslone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Nontesled Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauiing Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Tolal Cast

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - 3/8” Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Tolal Cost

Hauiing Rate
Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cosl

NO BID 12.58 NO BID 14,00 14.00
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
65.00 20.25 65.00 79.00 79.00

NO BID 5.64 NO BID 14.00 7.75

8.25 8.25 825 8.25 8.25
8.25 20.25 8.25 2225 16.00

NO BID 217 NO BID 3.85 5.50
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
18.00 20.25 18.00 21.85 2350

NO BID 2.17 NO BID 3.85 5.50
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
16.50 2025 16.50 20.35 22.00

NO 81D 2.17 NO BID 3.85 5.50
23.00 23.00 2300 23.00 23.00
23.00 2517 23.00 26.85 28.50

NO BID 217 NO BID 3.85 5.50
20.00 20.00 20.00 2000 20.00
20.00 2217 20.00 23.85 2550

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00

6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 22,09 6.25 21.25 20.25

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
12.50 s 12.50 27.50 26.50

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
11.50 27.34 11.50 26.50 2550

NO BID 15.84 NO BID 15.00 14.00

8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
2.00 23.84 8.00 23.00 22.00
NO BID 18.44 NO BID 13.00 13.75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 24.69 6.25 19.25 20.00
NO BID 18.44 NO BID 13.00 13.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 |
7.25 25.60 7.25 20.25 21.00

NO BID 8.11 NO BID 8.25 12.00
66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
66.00 7511 66.00 74,25 78.00




Texas Bit

Hauling Rate NO 8ID 9,11 NO BID 8.25 12.00
Malakoff Material Rale - Hol Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 81.00 90.11 81.00 89.25 93.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate NO BID 9.11 NO BID 8.25 12.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost 83.00 92.11 8§3.00 91.25 95.00
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks In Trucks in Trucks In Trucks in Trucks in Fleet
Fleet (Unlimited) Fleet (5) Fleet {Unlimited) | Flest (Unlimited) (Unlimited})
$85.00 Per Hr $75.00 Per Hr Delivery Time: Dalivery Time:
$7.00 per lon $6.,00 per lon When Needed Open
Bam to Jobsite Barn to Jobsite Min/Max Min/Max
A8 perloaded .18 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivary Qty:
lon per mile ton per mile 12 min{27 max 13 mini25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Bam to Delivery Schedule
project site. None
Hourly Truck work Bobtail $75.00 hr
is $80,00 per hour Belly End Dump
within s 20-mile $100.00 per hr

radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
thatisn't covered
by the rate sheet
{page 9) will ba
figured at .20

per ton mile loadad




Precinct 3 - Dawson

Coker & Son Havoc

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportati on_ T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rata NO BID $2.80 NO BID 9.00 8.75
Blum Materia} Rale - Flox Base A Grada 1 & 2 550 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Total Cost 5,50 18.30 5.50 14.50 15.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.58 NO BID 16,50 18.50
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Total Cost 9.00 26.58 9.00 25.50
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID 17.58 NO BID 16.50 18.50
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrate 9.50 950 9.50 9.50 9.50
Total Cost 9.50 27.08 9.50 26.00 28.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 5.86 NO BID 7.75 8.50
Corsicana Malerial Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Total Cost 65.00 70.86 65.00 72.75 73.50
|Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NC BiD 716 NO BID 7.75 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rale - Flexbase AM/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Totat Cost B.00 15.16 8.00 1575 16.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 716 NO BID 1.75 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 15.25 15.50
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rats NO BID 7.16 NO BID 7.75 8.00
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - Type "C" Rock, Type "0” Rock, Grade 3 Coverstone _2000 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Total Cosl 20.00 27.16 20.00 27.75 28.00
Cleveland Asphalt Hauling Rate NO BID 36.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rale - Calonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 416.50 453,39 416.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Tolal Cost 7.75 14.69 7.75 15.24 15.75
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesbeck Material Rale - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 7.50 14.44 7.50 14.99 15.50
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate NOBID 6.94 NO BID 7.49 8.00
Groesheck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Total Cost 8.00 1494 8.00 15.49 16.00
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate NO BID 8.0 NO BID 11.00 8.00
Knife River - Sky High Malerial Rate - Flex Base Type A1/2 20.25 29.25 29.25 20.25 29.25
Total Cost 29.25 38.15 29.25 40.25 37.25
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID 7.81 NO BID 10.00 10.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 60.00 60.00 60.00 50.00 60.00
Total Cost 60.00 67.81 €0.00 70.00 70.50




Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

|Martin Marietta
Corsicanz Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix/Cold Laid Item 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C* Limesione & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Nontested Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4" Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2" Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rale - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand
Tolal Cost

NO BID 7.81 NOBID 10.00 10.50
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
65.00 20.25 65.00 75.00 75.50

NO BID 7.16 NO BID 10.00 8.00

8.25 8.25 8.25 8.25 825
8.25 20.25 8.25 18.25 16.25

NO BID 5.86 NO BID 6.50 7.50
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
18.00 20.25 18.00 24.50 25.50

NO BID S.86 NOBID 6.50 7.50
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
16.50 20.25 16.50 23.00 24.00

NO BID 5.86 NO 8ID 6.50 7.50
23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
23.00 28.86 23.00 29.50 30.50

NO BID 5.86 NO8ID 6.50 7.50
20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 2000
20.00 25.86 20.00 26.50 27.50

NOBID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50

6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25
6.25 17.32 6.25 19.25 16.75

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
12.50 - 12.50 25.50 23.00

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
11.50 22.57 11.50 24.50 22.00

NO BID 11.07 NO BID 13.00 10.50

8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
a.00 19.07 8.00 21.00 18.50
NO BID 12.80 NO BID 9.00 9,75
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 §.25
6.25 19.05 6.25 15.25 16.00
NO BID 12.80 NO BID 9.00 9.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
7.25 20.05 7.25 16.25 17.00

NO BID 11.07 NOBID 9.25 13.25
66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
66.00 77.07 66.00 75.25 79.25

SH—



within a 20-mile
radius, 4-hr min
Any other hauling
that Isn't covered
by the rate shoet
{page 9) will be
figured at .20

per ton mils loaded

Texas Bit Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 9.25 13,25
Malakoff Material Rate - Hol Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 81.00 92.07 81.00 90.25 94.25
Texas Bit Hauling Rate NO BID 11.07 NO BID 9.25 13.25
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix B3.00 83.00 83.00 8300 83.00
Total Cost 83.00 94.07 83.00 92.25 96.25
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks In Trucks In Trucks (n Trucks in Trucks in Flest
Fieet {Unlimited) Fleat (5) Fleat (Unlimited) Flaet {Unlimited) {Unlimited)
$85.00 Per Hr $75.00 Per Hr Delivary Tima: Delivery Tima:
$7.00 perton $6.00 per ton When Needed Opan
Bam to Jobslte Bamn to Jobsits Min/Max Min/Max
.18 per loaded .18 per foaded Dalivery Qty: Delivery Qty:
ton per mile ton permlile 12 min/27 max 13 min/25 max
$125,00 per load Limltations to
from Bamn to Dellvary Schedule
project site. Nona
Hourly Truck work Bobtail $75.00 hr
is $80.00 par hour Baelly End Dump

$100.00 per hr




Precinct 4 - Blooming Grove

Coker & Son Havoe

Plant Rates BM Logistics Trucking Transportation T Bar D Trucking Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 9.55 11.93 9.25 8.95 9.75
Blum Material Rale - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 550 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50
Totat Cost 15.05 17.43 14.75 14.45 15.25
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 12.55 13.89 13.00 18.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Wasle 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00

Tolal Cost 21.55 22.89 22,00 27.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 12.55 13.89 13.00 18.00 18.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
Total Cost 22.05 23.39 22 50 27.50 27.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 6.60 4.77 6.50 9.00 8.50
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
Talal Cost 71.60 69.77 71.50 74.00 73.50
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 9.00 9,00
Groesheck Material Rate - Flexbase A/1/2 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
Tolal Cost 8.00 20.58 8.00 17.00 17.00
Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 9.00 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rale - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Tolal Cost 22.00 23.00 7.50 16.50 16.50
Big Greek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 12.58 NO BID 9.00 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Type “C" Rock, Type "P" Rock, Grade 3 Coversione 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00
Tolal Cost 20.00 32.58 20.00 29.00 29.00
Cleveland Asphait Hauling Rate 40.00 38.41 40.00 NO BID NO BID
Shepherd Material Rale - Catonic Emulsion; Minimum 21 ton load 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50 416.50
Total Cost 456.50 454,91 456.50 416.50 416.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.49 10.42 8.40 8.30 9,00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75 7.75
Tolal Cost 16.24 18.17 16.15 16.05 16.75
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 8.49 10.42 8.40 8.30 9.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50 7.50
Total Cost 15.99 17.92 15.90 15.80 16.50
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 8.45 10.42 8.40 8.30 9.00
Groesbeck Malerial Rate - 2" Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 142 B.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 B.00
Total Cost 16.45 18.42 16.40 16.30 17.00
King Sand & Gravel Hauling Rate 7.00 8.03 7.00 11.00 9.00
Knife River - Sky High Malerial Rate - Flex Base Type A/1/2 29.25 20.25 2925 29.25 29.25
Total Cost 36.25 37.28 36.25 40.25 38.25
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 11.50 13.00 11.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00
Total Cost 73.00 71.50 73.00 71.00 72.50




Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Gorsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

f_su:__. Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Mine Service Inc
Waco

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rale - Hot Mix/Cold Laid ltem 334 D-Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cosl

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type "C" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Materia! Rate - 1" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - Nonlesled Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - C-Rock 3/4* Crushed Gravel Nontested
Total Cost

Hauilng Rate
Material Rate - D/F Blend 3/8" - 1/2* Crushed Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rale - 3/8" Pea Gravel
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Malerial Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Tolal Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand
Total Cost

13.00 11.50 13.00 11.00 12.50
65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00 65.00
78.00 20.25 78.00 76.00 77.50
NO BID 10.63 NO BID 11.00 9.00
8.25 825 8.25 8.25 8.25
B.35 20.25 8.25 1925 17.25
6.10 477 6.50 5.68 .75
18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00 18.00
24.10 20.25 24.50 23.68 25.75
6.10 4.77 6.50 5.68 7.75
16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50 16.50
22.60 20.25 23.00 22.18 2425
6.10 4.77 6.50 5.68 7.75
23 00 23.00 23.00 23.00 23.00
29.10 27.77 29.50 28.68 30.75
6.10 a7 6.50 5.68 7.75
20.00 20.00 20.00 2000 20.00
26.10 24.77 26.50 2568 2775
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 6.25 |
16.05 21.66 15.75 19.25 18.75
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50 12.50
22.30 27.91 22.00 25,50 25.00
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
21.30 26.91 21.00 24.50 24.00
9.80 15.41 9.50 13.00 12.50
8.00 8.00 _8.00 B.00 8.00
17.80 23.41 17.50 21.00 20.50
9.55 11.93 9.25 8.95 8.75
6.25 6.25 625 625 6.25
15.60 18.18 15,50 15.20 16.00
9.55 11.93 9.25 8.95 9.75
7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25 7.25
16.80 19.18 16.50 16.20 17.00
9.80 9.98 9.50 12.00 12.50
66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00 66.00
75.80 75.98 75.50 78.00 78.50

=



Texas Bit Hauling Rate 9.80 9.98 9.50 12.00 12.50
MatakoH Material Rate - Hot Mix 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00 81.00
Total Cost 90.80 90.98 90.50 53.00 93.50
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 9.80 9.98 9,50 12.00 12.50
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 8§3.00 83.00 83.00 83.00 83.00
Total Cost 92.80 52.98 92.50 95.00 95.50
Numbar ol Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks In Trucks in Trucks In Trucks in Trucks in Fleat
Fleet {Unlimited) Fleet (5) Fiset (Unlimlted) Fleet {Unlimited) {Unlimited)
$85.00 Per Hr $75.00 Par Hr Delivery Time: Dellvery Time:
$7.00 per ton $6.00 per ton When Headed Open
Bam lo Jobsile Barn to Jobsite Min/iMax Min/Max
18 per loaded .18 per loaded Dalivery Quy: Dellvery Qty:
ton per mils lon per mile 12 minf27 max 13 min/25 max
$125.00 per load Limitations to
from Bam lo Delivery Schedule
project site. None
Hourly Truck work Boblail $75.00 hr
is $80.00 per hour Belly End Dump

within a 20.mile
radius, 4-hr min
Any other havling
that jsn't coverad
by the rate sheet
(page 8) will ba
figured at .20

per ton mile loaded

$100.00 per hr




B : OTHER
HaT HOT MIX FLEX | FLEX  TYPE | TYPE | GRADE 3 PEA a8 .ﬂm.mm
(Material picked up at pi/plant) Ol | HOT | COLD | CATIONIC | BASE | BASE B "D" | COVER |GRAVE| Dirty |Lightweight| Notes
VENDOR LOCATION SAND MIX LAID | EMULSION: | Al4/2 | AJ2j2 |WASTE| ROCK | ROCK | STONE L Rock Aggr Below)

Amold Crushed Stone Blum, TX 550 | 5.50 |

Big City Crushed Stone Dallas, TX 9.00 ]
| Big Creek Construction Corsicana, Groesbeck, Marlin 65.00 8.00 | 7.50 20.00 | 20.00 20.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc Shepherd, TX 416.50

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX 7.75] 7.50 1]

Havoc Transportation Demolition Blum, Mexia, Blum, Waco 7.00 14.50 v

Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX 8.00] 8.00 Vv

King Sand & Gravel Knife River - Sky High Plant 29.25

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck 60.00 65.00 8.25] B8.25 VI

Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX 6.25| 6.25 12,50 | 11.50 8.00 Vil

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Moit, TX Vil

Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX 6.25 7.25 1X

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 66.00 | 81.00 83.00

Martin Marietta Corsicana 18.00 | 16.50 23.00 | 23.00 20.00

{Matarial detivered) PCT1

Amold Crushed Stone Blum, TX |

Big City Crushed Stone Dallas, TX 29.00 1]
| Big Creek Construction Corsicana, Groesbeck, Mariin 75.00 20.00 | 18.50 32.00 | 32.00 32.00 | 25.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc Shepherd, TX 462.96

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX 1]

Havoc Transportation Demaolition Blum, Mexia, Blum, Waco 15.50 26.50 v

Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX v

King Sand & Gravel Knife River - Sky High Plant 18.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck Vi

Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX Vil

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX Vil

Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX I1X

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX

Martin Marietta Corsicana 22.00 | 20.50 27.00 | 27.00 24.00

(Material delivered) PCT 2 o

Arnold Crushed Stone Blum, TX I
| Big City Crushed Stone Dallas, TX 31.50 [}

Big Creek Construction Corsicana, Groesbeck, Marlin 75.00 20.00 | 19.50 32.00 | 32.00 3200 | 25.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc Shepherd, TX 462.96

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX ]

Havoc Transportation Demolition Blum, Mexia, Blum, Waco 16.25 28.50 v

Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX v
| King Sand & Gravel Knife River - Sky High Plant 21.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck Vi




Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX Vi

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX VIl

Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX X

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX

Martin Marieeta Corsicana 23.50 | 22.00 2B.50 | 28.50 25.50

HOT HOT MIX FLEX [ FLEX TYPE | TYPE | GRADE 3| PEA
OIL | HOT | COLD | CATIONIC | BASE | BASE *c* | “p* | COVER |GRAVE
{Material dgliversd) PCT3 SAND:| MIX [ LAID [ EMULSION | AMi2 | Aj2i2 |WASTE| ROCK | ROCK | STONE L OTHER

Arnold Crushed Stone Blum, TX 1
| Big City Crushed Stone Dallas, TX 31.50 [}

Big Creek Construction Corsicana, Groesbeck, Marlin 75.00 20.00 | 19.50 32.00 | 32.00 32.00 | 25.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc Shepherd, TX 462.96

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX [L1]

Havoc Transportation Demoalition Blum, Mexia, Blum, Waco - - - - - - v

Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX v

King Sand & Gravel Knife River - Sky High Plant 17.75

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck Vi

Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX Vil

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX VIl

Raltler Rock, Inc Blum, TX IX

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX

Martin Marietta 24.25 | 22.75 20.25 | 29.25 26.25

{Material delivered) PCT 4

Amold Crushed Stone Blum, TX |
| Big City Crushed Stone Dallas, TX 29.00 ]
| Big Creek Construction Corsicana, Groesbeck, Marlin 75.00 20.00 | 19.50 32.00 | 32.00 32.00 | 25.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc Shepherd, TX 462.96

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX 1]

Havoc Transportation Demolition Blum, Mexia, Blum, Waco 15.40 24.50 1"

Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX \'J

King Sand & Gravel Knife River - Sky High Plant 19.75

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck Vi

Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX Vil

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX VIl
| Ratiler Rock, Inc Blum, TX X

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX

Martin Marietta Corsicana 24.00 | 22.50 29.00 ] 29.00 26.00

Other Products offered are on last page.

Prices shown are per ton unless otherwise specified.




I. Amold Crushed Sions, Inc

1676 HCR 1104 LP

PO Box 632

Blum, TX 76627

|Mike Amold - Owner

Erica Haffner - General Manager
(254-998-4434
erica@arnoldcrushedstone.com

Oversize 3" x 5" $11.00/ton

Gabion 4" x 8" $13.50/ton

Rip Rap 8" x 12" $23.00/ton

Rlp Rap 12" x 18", 18" x 24", 24" + $22.00/ton
Fines $4.00/ton

Torpedo Rock 3/8" minus $6.25/ton

1.5" Screened 3/4" - 1 3/4™ $16.75/ton

#57 Rock 314" - 1 1/4" $16.75/ton

iI. Big City Crushed Concrete
11143Goodnight Lane

PO Bax 28816

Dallas, TX 75229

Josh Hylema

972-243-5820

josh@beeclp.com

Bidding Crushed Concrate Item 247 Flex Base
Material picked up: $§9.50/ton

Applied to road In Pct 1 - $29.50/ton

Applied to road In Pct 2 - $32.00/ton

Applied to road In Pct 3 - $32.00/ton

Applied to road in Pct 4 - $29.50/ton

Il. Conners Crushed Stone
2513 US Hwy 77

Lolt, TX 78655

Hailey Sudduth, Sales
254-584-2011
HaileySudduth@gmail.com

Material Only:

Limestone 3/4 Minus - $5.00/ton
Limestone 1 x 3 Rock - $14.00/ton
Limestone 3 x 5 Rock - $12.00/ton

Limestone Commercial Base - $7.50/ton tan base
Limestone Standard Base - $6.50/ton gray base

*** Commercial Standard Base is available at Laguna Park: Greenewade Que

IV. Havac Transportation
7956 NW CR 4060 #57
Blooming Grove, TX 76626
Jason Drain - Owner
903-257-5365

havociran igngdemotiti

Blum Tan Base

Material Only: $7.00
Applied to Pct 1 - $18.85
Applied to Pct 2 - $20.85
Applied to Pct 3 - No Bid
Applied to Pct 4 - $16.68

Oversized Limestone Rock (1 x 3 or 3 x 5) - Waco

Material Only: $10.00

Applied to Pct 1 - $22.00
Applied to Pct 2 - $24.00
Applied to Pct 3 - No Bid
Applied to Pct 4 - $20.00

Blum Blue Base

Material Only: $6.00
Applied to Pct 1 - $17.85
Applied to Pct 2 - $19.85
Applied to Pct 3 - No Bid
Applied to Pct 4 - $15.68

173 CR 1090 Clifton, TX 76634 ***
Base Limestone: Flexbase - Waco

Material Only: $6.50

Applied to Pct 1 - $18.50

Applied to Pct 2 - $20.50

Applied to Pct 3 - No Bid

Applied to Pct 4 - $16.50

Oversized Limestone Rock (1 x 3 or 3 x 5) - Blum

Material Only: $7.00

Applied to Pct 1 - $18.85
Applied to Pct 2 - $20.85
Applied to Pct 3 - No Bid
Applied to Pct 4 - $16.68

V. Helmcamp Materials, Ltd
PO Box 456

Buffalo, TX 75831

Chad Thomas, Vice President
903-626-5911
james.carlisle@helmcampmaterials.com

Select Fill - $4.00/ton

1" Base - $5.00/ton

1 x 3 Limestone - $17.00/ton

3 x 5 Limestone - $17.00/ton

6 x 12 Limestone - $27.00/ton
12 x 18 Limestone - $27.00/ton
18 + Limestone - $30.00/ton
Top Soil - $4.50/ton




V1. Knife River Corp - South
6310 Hwy 21 West

Bryan, TX 77807

Johnnie Pickens, Sales Manager
254-709-0290

johnnie pickens@kniferiver.com

Rip Rap 1 x 3 - §19.00/ton

Rip Rap 3 x 5 - $19.00/ton

Rip Rap 4 x 8 - $19.00/ton

Rip Rap 6 x 12 - $31.00/ton

Rip Rap 12 x 18 - $32.00/ton

Rip Rap 18 x 24 - $34.00/ton

** All Rip Rap items priced avove are FOB Sky High Quarry** 3812 FM 1633 West - Groesbeck, TX

VII. Mine Service, Inc
PO Box 32

Rockdale, TX 76567
Euell Campbell
512-446-7011

euellcampbell

Torpedo Rock could be used for pipebedding $4.00/ton
1953 Tom Ledbetter Rd - Waco, TX 76712

VIl. P Squared Emulsions Plant, LLC
516 South Mclennan Loop

Elm Mott, TX 76640

George Tomek, Area Sales
254-828-0330
george@p2emulsions.com

Product Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB County

P2 Stabilizer $2.44 $ 269 $ 264
P2S1 $2.44 $ 2.69 $ 264
P2 CWE-2 (Chip Seal $2.74 $ 2.99 $ 2.94
P2 CWP (Cold Weather Patch) $2.74 $ 2.99 $ 2.94
P2 ROC (Road Over Coat) $2.57 $ 282 $ 2.77
P2 Rejuvenator $2.47 $ 2.72 $ 2.67
P2 Prime Concentrate $1.79 $ 204 $ 1.99

**All listed prices are per U.S. gallon

“*Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons

**Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges

“*Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour thereafter

“*Pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00

**Push Charge (trucking charge}: $80.00 per hour

**Return Loads (trucking charge): Subject to charge from delivering freigit line

**Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential of $0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal
**Quote attached to bid tabulation packet for Commissioners to reference to.**

IX. Rattler Rock, Inc

PO Box 10

Blum, TX 76627

Charles L Davis 1l - President

254-874-5282

1" - 3" screened rock $7.25/on
untested blue base $5.25/ton

Above jtems are sold when available

Contracts awarded to all bidders.

Drum/ Tote Plant




